BID TABULATION #575

HOSES, 1-3/4" & 3"

PURCHASING AGENT: AILEEN HALEY
TELEPHONE NO.: 414-286-3506

BIDDER: QTY ITEM 1 SUB-TOTAL QTY ITEM 2 SUB-TOTAL TOTAL
AMERICAN MILLWORK/HARDWARE 287 NO BID 100 NO BID

BENDLIN FIRE EQUIPMENT CO 287 $58.50 $16,789.50 100 $113.20 $11,320.00 $28,109.50
DENNIS BAHCALL RUBBER CO 287 $61.69 $17,705.03 100 $124.45 $12,445.00 $30,150.03
ELVIN SAFETY SUPPLY INC 287 NO BID 100 NO BID

GENERAL FIRE EQUIPMENT CO 287 $59.50 $17,076.50 100 $113.75 $11,375.00 $28,451.50
INTERSTATE FIRE PROTECTION SERV 287 $59.86 $17,179.82 100 $115.29 $11,529.00 $28,708.82
JOHN M ELLSWORTH CO 287 $71.82 $20,612.34 100 $135.09 $13,509.00 $34,121.34
KIDDE FIRE FIGHTING 287 $83.25 $23,892.75 100 $175.59 $17,559.00 $41,451.75
OSHKOSH FIRE/POLICE EQUIPMENT 287 NON-COMPLYING 100 NON-COMPLYING

W S DARLEY & CO 287 $62.20 $17,851.40 100 $120.25 $12,025.00 $29,876.40
WISCONSIN LIFT TRUCK CORP 287 NO BID 100 NO BID

AWARD WILL BE MADE BY LINE ITEM OR IN TOTAL (LINE ITEMS 1 & 2) TO THE LOWEST RESPONSIBLE AND RESPONSIVE BIDDER COMPLYING
WITH THE SPECIFICATIONS AND THE SPECIFIED DELIVERHY REQUIREMENTS.



